






































Invitation for Bid 06815 - Addendum 2 Appendix B - Specifications

Pre-qualified Products

Ennis Paint - Ennis-TX

Raised pavement markers and adhesives shall conform to the requirements of 
the 2014 Washington State Department of Transportation (WSDOT) Standard 
Specifications for Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction and be listed on the 
Qualified Product List (QPL).  Information about the WSDOT Specifications for 
Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction can be found at the following web 
address:
http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/Publications/Manuals/M41-10.htm
Information about the WSDOT QPL can be found at the following web address:
 http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/biz/mats/QPL/QPL.cfm

The following Thermoplastic Pavement Marking have been pre-qualified and 
listed on the QPL by the Washington State Department of Transportation:

Flint Trading Inc., Thomasville-NC

Product Name:  Flame Tape - Plastic Type B: Pre-formed Fused Thermoplastic

Potter's Industries, Greenville-AL
Product Name:  VisiTape - Plastic Type B: Pre-formed Fused Thermoplastic

Product Name:  Premark - Plastic Type B: Pre-formed Fused Thermoplastic

Flint Trading Inc., Thomasville-NC
Product Name:  Hot Tape - Plastic Type B: Pre-formed Fused Thermoplastic

1 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.
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Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4" wide x 36" long 1,000 5.31$                   5,310.00$                  
2 8" wide x 36" long 1,000 10.58$                 10,580.00$                
3 12" wide x 36" long 1,000 15.88$                 15,880.00$                
4 24" wide x 36" long 1,000 31.75$                 31,750.00$                

Total: 63,520.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4" wide x 36" long 1,000 5.63$                   5,630.00$                  
2 8" wide x 36" long 1,000 12.16$                 12,160.00$                
3 12" wide x 36" long 1,000 16.69$                 16,690.00$                
4 24" wide x 36" long 1,000 33.37$                 33,370.00$                

Total: 67,850.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Hand Kits, Left 500 154.08$               77,040.00$                
2 Hand Kits, Right 500 154.08$               77,040.00$                

Total: 154,080.00$              

Category A

Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color: white

Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category B

Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color:  yellow
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category C

WA Low Speed combo arrow. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics. 13’ 4” tall X 3’ 4” wide

Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category D

2 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Hand Kits, Left 500 80.73$                 40,365.00$                
2 Hand Kits, Right 500 80.73$                 40,365.00$                

Total: 80,730.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 8' tall x 2'6" wide 500 83.75$                 41,875.00$                
Total: 41,875.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4' tall x 2' 500 98.89$                 49,445.00$                
Total: 49,445.00$                

WA Low Speed turn arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'8" wide
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category E

WA Low Speed straight arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'6" wide
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category F

Bicycle symbol.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

3 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Rail road crossing kit 250 455.40$               113,850.00$              
Total: 113,850.00$              

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/lb. Extended Price

1 8' tall 1,000 68.13$                 68,130.00$                
Total: 68,130.00$                

Category G

Rail road crossing kit. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category H

Pre-formed thermoplastic letter with skip optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: PreMark

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

4 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4" wide x 36" long 1,000 4.96$                   4,960.00$                  
2 8" wide x 36" long 1,000 9.90$                   9,900.00$                  
3 12" wide x 36" long 1,000 15.02$                 15,020.00$                
4 24" wide x 36" long 1,000 30.02$                 30,020.00$                

Total: 59,900.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4" wide x 36" long 1,000 5.20$                   5,200.00$                  
2 8" wide x 36" long 1,000 10.31$                 10,310.00$                
3 12" wide x 36" long 1,000 15.72$                 15,720.00$                
4 24" wide x 36" long 1,000 31.43$                 31,430.00$                

Total: 62,660.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Hand Kits, Left 500 145.52$               72,760.00$                
2 Hand Kits, Right 500 145.52$               72,760.00$                

Total: 145,520.00$              

Category A

Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color: white

Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category B

Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color:  yellow
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category C

WA Low Speed combo arrow. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics. 13’ 4” tall X 3’ 4” wide

Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category D

5 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Hand Kits, Left 500 76.25$                 38,125.00$                
2 Hand Kits, Right 500 76.25$                 38,125.00$                

Total: 76,250.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 8' tall x 2'6" wide 500 79.09$                 39,545.00$                
Total: 39,545.00$                

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 4' tall x 2' 500 90.81$                 45,405.00$                
Total: 45,405.00$                

WA Low Speed turn arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'8" wide
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category E

WA Low Speed straight arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'6" wide
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category F

Bicycle symbol.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

6 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815 Addendum 2 Appendix B - Price Sheet Additions 

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 Rail road crossing kit 250 421.52$               105,380.00$              
Total: 105,380.00$              

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/lb. Extended Price

1 8' tall 1,000 63.50$                 63,500.00$                
Total: 63,500.00$                

Category G

Rail road crossing kit. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category H

Pre-formed thermoplastic letter with skip optics
Mfg.: Flint Trading, Inc. Model: HotTape

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

7 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid #06815 
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Price Sheet   

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 1W 40,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 1Y 2,000 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 2YY 30,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 2W 35,000 No Bid No Bid
3 RPM Type 2Y 8,000 No Bid No Bid
4 RPM Type 2WR 500 No Bid No Bid
5 RPM Type 2YR 500 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 2YY 27,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 2W 7,000 No Bid No Bid
3 RPM Type 2Y 1,000 No Bid No Bid
4 RPM Type 2WR 500 No Bid No Bid
5 RPM Type 2YR 500 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens
Mfg.: Model:

Category A

Model:
4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens

Category C

Category B

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 1, Non-reflective
Model:Mfg.:

Mfg.:

1 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid #06815 
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Price Sheet   

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 2YY 19,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 2W 9,000 No Bid No Bid
3 RPM Type 2Y 3,100 No Bid No Bid
4 RPM Type 2WR 10,000 No Bid No Bid
5 RPM Type 2YR 1,600 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 2YY 5,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 2W 17,800 No Bid No Bid
3 RPM Type 2Y 10,000 No Bid No Bid
4 RPM Type 2WR 1,000 No Bid No Bid
5 RPM Type 2YR 500 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1 RPM Type 2YY 1,000 No Bid No Bid
2 RPM Type 2W 3,750 No Bid No Bid
3 RPM Type 2Y 1,000 No Bid No Bid
4 RPM Type 2WR 500 No Bid No Bid
5 RPM Type 2YR 500 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Mfg.: Model:

Mfg.: Model:

3.2” x 4.6” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

Recessed Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

Category D

Category E

Mfg.: Model:

Category F

2 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid #06815 
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Price Sheet   

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/ Each Extended Price

1
Temporary RPM Type W with 
protective cover 20,000 No Bid No Bid

2
Temporary RPM Type YY with 
protective cover 20,000 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/lb. Extended Price

1
Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for 
Pavement Markers 15,148 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Item Description
Est. Annual 
Usage (*) Unit Price/lb. Extended Price

1 BC 2000 White 1,000 No Bid No Bid
2 BC 2000 Yellow 1,000 No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid

Mfg.:

Category H

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Category I

Pavement Marking Plastic Type A: Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic
Model:

Mfg.: Model:

Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers
Mfg.:

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.

Model:

Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker (RPM)

Category G

3 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Minimum Order Requirements

Northwest Region:

North Central Region: Washington State Department of Transportation
1551 North Wenatchee Ave, Wenatchee, WA  98807

Olympic Region: Washington State Department of Transportation
5720 Capitol Boulevard, Tumwater, WA  98501

Southwest Region: Washington State Department of Transportation
4200 Main Street, Vancouver, WA  98663

South Central Region: Washington State Department of Transportation
2809 Rudkin Road, Union Gap, WA  98903

Eastern Region: Washington State Department of Transportation
2714 North Mayfair Street, Spokane, WA  99207

Section Northwest 
Region

North 
Central 
Region

Olympic 
Region

Southwest 
Region

South 
Central 
Region

Eastern 
Region

“A” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“B” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“C” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“D” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“E” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“F” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“G” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“H” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
“I” N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Minimum order requirements per each district - by dollar amount not to exceed $3,500

Washington State Department of Transportation
6431 Corson Avenue South, Seattle, WA  98108

This section will not be evaluated.  Bidder is to list any minimum order requirements as a dollar 
amount not to exceed $3,500 for deliveries, FOB Destination Prepaid and Included.

After award of contract, the contractor may charge the purchaser freight charges for orders that do 
not meet the minimum order requirements (FOB Destination Prepaid and Add to invoice).

Delivery for the primary user (WSDOT) will be required at the following six Department of 
Transportation Regions on a demand basis:

Customers are located throughout the State of Washington

4 Bidder's Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc.



Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Specifications

Category
A
B
C
D
E
F
G
H
I

Colors
Colors for Raised Pavement Markers shall be consistent with the following table:

Type 1W White
Type 1Y Yellow

Type 2YY Yellow and Yellow
Type 2W White – one side only
Type 2Y Yellow – one side only
Type 2WR White and Red
Type 2YR Yellow and Red

Type W White – one side only
Type YY Yellow – both sides

General
This contract shall furnish Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesive for the following 
categories:

RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 1 COLORS

RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 2 COLORS

TEMPORARY FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT MARKER
REFLECTIVE TAPE COLORS

Recessed Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant   
Temporary Flexible Pavement Marker
Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers
Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic, Type A

Product
Raised Pavement Marker, Type 1, Non-reflective
4 x 4 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens
4 x 4 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant
3.2 x 4.6 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant
Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant

5



Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Specifications

Pre-qualified Products

Category A - Raised Pavement Marker, Type 1, Non-reflective

Alpine Products Inc. – Auburn, WA
Alpine Model “ANR-W & ANR-Y”

Apex Universal Inc. - Santa Fe Springs, CA
Model “929 ABS”

Interstates Sales - Auburn, CA
Model “Diamond Back Polypropylene”

Novabrite LLC - Livermore, CA
Model “ADOT-W and ADOT-Y ABS”

Tenacity Inc. – Sedro Wooley, WA
Model “RPM T1”

Three D Traffic Works, Inc. - Burbank-CA
Pathfinder Model TD 10500

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model 88 (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH
Ray-O-Lite Model AA (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

Tenacity Inc. – Sedro Wooley, WA
Model “RPM T2” (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

Category B – 4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with uncoated lens

Information about the WSDOT QPL can be found at the following web address:
http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/Publications/Manuals/M41-10.htm

Raised pavement markers and adhesives shall conform to the requirements of the 2014 
Washington State Department of Transportation (WSDOT) Standard Specifications for 
Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction and be listed on the Qualified Product List 
(QPL).  Information about the WSDOT Specifications for Road, Bridge and Municipal 
Construction can be found at the following web address:

 http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/biz/mats/QPL/QPL.cfm
The following Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives have been pre-qualified and 
listed on the QPL by the Washington State Department of Transportation:

6
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Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Specifications

Apex Universal Inc. - Santa Fe Springs, CA
Model 921 AR (4”x 4”x 0.75”)

Category C - continued

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model 911(4”x 4”x 0.7”)

Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc., - Newark, OH
Ray-O-Lite Model AA-ARC II (4”x 4”x 0.7”) and Model RS-ARC (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model C80 (3.2”x 4.6”x 0.66”)

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model 948 (2.3”x 4.7”x 0.5”)

Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH
Ray-O-Lite Model 2002 (2.3”x 4.7”x 0.5”)

(For recessed application only)

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model 944SB (2”x 4”x 0.5”)

Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH
Ray-O-Lite Model 2004 (2”x 4”x 0.5”)

Apex Universal Inc. – Santa Fe Springs, CA
Seal Coat Marker

Pexco, Davidson Traffic Control Products – Tacoma, WA
Model TRPM 

Category E –  Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion 
resistant lens

Category C – 4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion resistant 

Category F – Recessed Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion 

Category G - Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker with clear polyvinyl chloride 
protective cover

Category D – 3.2” x 4.6” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion 
resistant lens

7



Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives

Appendix B - Specifications

Category H - Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers

Crafco Inc. – Chandler, AZ
Hot Applied Flexible Pavement Marker Adhesive, Part No. 34270

Henry Company – Elk Grove, CA
Flexible DOT Stick

Category I - Pavement Marking Plastic Type A: Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic

Ennis Paint – Niles, IL
Stimsonite Model BC2000

The following flexible bituminous pavement marker adhesives have been pre-qualified by the 
Washington State department of Transportation:

Flexible bituminous pavement marker adhesive for raised pavement markers shall conform to the 
requirements of Amended Section 9-02.1 (8) of the 2008 WSDOT Standard Specifications for 
Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction.
Material shall be packaged in self-releasing disposable containers that will stack properly.  The 
containers shall be divided into compartments so that three or four equal individual parts are 
obtained from each container.  Package dividers shall be free of over-spill material providing for 
easy separation and removal.  The label for the container shall clearly show the manufacturer, 
quantity, lot or batch number, and an indication that the material is flexible bituminous adhesive for 
pavement markers.
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Bidder Profile – Appendix C 
Invitation for Bid 06815 – Raised Pavement Markers & Adhesive 

COMPANY INFORMATION (for contract administration purposes) 

Company name and address 
Flint Trading, Inc. 
115 Todd Court 
Thomasville, NC 27360 

Authorized 
representative: Dane Alsabrook 

Phone/Cell: (336) 308-3767 

Email: contracts@ennisflint.com 

Ordering contact/Address 
Name/Email: Shannon Franklin   
                      sales@flinttrading.com 
Address: 115 Todd Court 
                Thomasville, NC 27360 
Phone: (336) 308-3781  

Sales reporting contact information 
Name/Email: Anne Selby 
Phone: (336) 308-3767 

Management fee contact 
Name/Email: Anne Selby 
Phone: (336) 308-3767 

Address to send management fee invoices 
Company Name: Flint Trading, Inc. 
Attn: Anne Selby 
Address:115 Todd Court 
City/State/Zip: Thomasville, NC 27360 

Wash. Dept. of Revenue Registration No. 601891622 

Federal Tax ID No.  (TIN)* 56-1736552 

*If your TIN is a Social Security Number, 
provide only the last four digits 

 
N/A 

REFERENCES 

Provide a minimum of three commercial or government references for which bidder has delivered goods 
and/or services similar in scope as described in the IFB. 

1. Customer: 
Contact: 
Phone: 
Email: 

City of Seattle 
Adrian (AJ) Verdugo 
(206) 684-8820 
adrian.verdugo@seattle.gov 

2. Customer: 
Contact: 
Phone: 
Email: 

Pierce County 
Steve Martin 
(253) 531-6990 
smartin@co.pierce.wa.us 

3. Customer: 
Contact: 
Phone: 
Email: 

City of Spokane 
Ron Meredith 
(509) 232-8816 
rmeredith@spokanecity.org 

 



Bidder Profile – Appendix C 
Invitation for Bid #06815 – Raised Pavement Markers & Adhesive 
 
 
 

Washington State Department of Enterprise Services (DES)  Page 2 of 2 

 

SUBCONTRACTORS 

If applicable, identify on a separate sheet any subcontractors who will perform services in fulfillment of 
contract requirements. State the nature of services to be performed and include a federal tax identification 
number (TIN) for each subcontractor. If a subcontractor is a minority or woman-owned business, include 
its OMWBE Certification Number (if certified). If necessary, attach additional sheets (stamp or mark each 
page with a company name, mark or initial). Do not include any Social Security Numbers. 

The contractor, by including subcontractor(s) as part of your signed bid, agrees to assume responsibility 
for contract obligations and any liability for all actions of such subcontractors. DES reserves the right to 
approve or disapprove any subcontractor. 

SALES/CUSTOMER SERVICE 

On a separate sheet, identify sales/customer service contacts and will call locations for the entire state. 

PURCHASING CARDS 

Purchasing cards accepted (note: any card fees must be rolled into the unit price of the bid): 

 Visa   Master Card   American Express   Discover   Other:       

MINORITY/WOMEN OWNED BUSINESS STATUS 

Is your firm a minority/women-owned business?  Yes   No  

MWBE certification no.       

VETERAN OWNED BUSINESS STATUS 

Is your firm a veteran-owned business?  Yes   No  

VB certification no.       

STATE OF OREGON 

If required, indicate percent increase to bid pricing for delivery to State of Oregon DASCPP/ORCPP 
members:  0 percent. 

Lead Time:  Fifteen (15) days 
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